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Daniel 1-5 It pleased Darius to appoint 120 satraps to rule throughout the kingdom, 2 with three
administrators over them, one of whom was Daniel. The satraps were made accountable to them
so that the king might not suffer loss. 3 Now Daniel so distinguished himself among the
administrators and the satraps by his exceptional qualities that the king planned to set him over
the whole kingdom. 4 At this, the administrators and the satraps tried to find grounds for charges
against Daniel in his conduct of government affairs, but they were unable to do so. They could find
no corruption in him, because he was trustworthy and neither corrupt nor negligent. 5 Finally these
men said, “We will never find any basis for charges against this man Daniel unless it has something
to do with the law of his God.”

· God plans for our character to be developed for His glory.

Daniel 1:8 But Daniel resolved not to defile himself with the royal food and wine, and he asked the
chief official for permission not to defile himself this way.

Romans 5:3-4 “…we also glory in our sufferings, because we know that suffering produces
perseverance; 4 perseverance, character; and character, hope.”

· Hope: A confident expectation of Gods ability to save and rescue.

2 Timothy 3:12-13 In fact, everyone who wants to live a godly life in Christ Jesus will be persecuted,
13 while evildoers and impostors will go from bad to worse, deceiving and being deceived.

Daniel 6:6-9 So these administrators and satraps went as a group to the king and said: “May King
Darius live forever! 7 The royal administrators, prefects, satraps, advisers and governors have all
agreed that the king should issue an edict and enforce the decree that anyone who prays to any
god or human being during the next thirty days, except to you, Your Majesty, shall be thrown into
the lions’ den. 8 Now, Your Majesty, issue the decree and put it in writing so that it cannot be
altered—in accordance with the law of the Medes and Persians, which cannot be repealed.” 9 So
King Darius put the decree in writing.

· Faithfulness to God fuels opposition from the world.

John 15:18-19 If the world hates you, keep in mind that it hated me first. 19 If you belonged to the
world, it would love you as its own. As it is, you do not belong to the world, but I have chosen you
out of the world. That is why the world hates you.

Daniel 6:10-16 Now when Daniel learned that the decree had been published, he went home to his
upstairs room where the windows opened toward Jerusalem. Three times a day he got down on his
knees and prayed, giving thanks to his God, just as he had done before. 11 Then these men went as
a group and found Daniel praying and asking God for help. 12 So they went to the king and spoke
to him about his royal decree: “Did you not publish a decree that during the next thirty days
anyone who prays to any god or human being except to you, Your Majesty, would be thrown into
the lions’ den?” The king answered, “The decree stands—in accordance with the law of the Medes
and Persians, which cannot be repealed.” 13 Then they said to the king, “Daniel, who is one of the
exiles from Judah, pays no attention to you, Your Majesty, or to the decree you put in writing. He
still prays three times a day.” 14 When the king heard this, he was greatly distressed; he was
determined to rescue Daniel and made every effort until sundown to save him. 15 Then the men
went as a group to King Darius and said to him, “Remember, Your Majesty, that according to the
law of the Medes and Persians no decree or edict that the king issues can be changed.” 16 So the
king gave the order, and they brought Daniel and threw him into the lions’ den. The king said to
Daniel, “May your God, whom you serve continually, rescue you!”

· God plans for prayer to be a primary part of our relationship with Him.

· Prayer helps us reprioritize our obedience.

· Prayer helps us to reveal the real issue.

· Prayer helps us be prepared for what is to come.

Acts 5:29 But Peter and the apostles replied, “We must obey God rather than any human
authority.

Daniel 6:17-23 A stone was brought and placed over the mouth of the den, and the king sealed it
with his own signet ring and with the rings of his nobles, so that Daniel’s situation might not be
changed. 18 Then the king returned to his palace and spent the night without eating and without
any entertainment being brought to him. And he could not sleep. 19 At the first light of dawn, the
king got up and hurried to the lions’ den. 20 When he came near the den, he called to Daniel in an
anguished voice, “Daniel, servant of the living God, has your God, whom you serve continually,
been able to rescue you from the lions?” 21 Daniel answered, “May the king live forever! 22 My
God sent his angel, and he shut the mouths of the lions. They have not hurt me, because I was
found innocent in his sight. Nor have I ever done any wrong before you, Your Majesty.” 23 The king
was overjoyed and gave orders to lift Daniel out of the den. And when Daniel was lifted from the
den, no wound was found on him, because he had trusted in his God.

· Gods’ plans always include Gods’ power and presence.

Psalm 56:9 This I know, because God is for me.

· Providence: God is for me, not against me. (Romans 8)

1 Peter 5:8 Be alert and of sober mind. Your enemy the devil prowls around like a roaring lion
looking for someone to devour.

1 John 3:8b The reason the Son of God appeared was to destroy the devil’s work.

Daniel 6:24-28 At the king’s command, the men who had falsely accused Daniel were brought in
and thrown into the lions’ den, along with their wives and children. And before they reached the
floor of the den, the lions overpowered them and crushed all their bones. 25 Then King Darius
wrote to all the nations and peoples of every language in all the earth: “May you prosper greatly!
2 6 “I issue a decree that in every part of my kingdom people must fear and reverence the God of
Daniel. “For he is the living God and he endures forever; his kingdom will not be destroyed, his
dominion will never end. 27 He rescues and he saves; he performs signs and wonders in the
heavens and on the earth. He has rescued Daniel from the power of the lions.” 28 So Daniel
prospered during the reign of Darius and the reign of Cyrus he Persian.

· God plans to use you to make Himself known throughout the earth.

Hebrews 7:25 Therefore he is able to save completely those who come to God through him,
because he always lives to intercede for them.

John 3:16 For God so loved the world that he gave his one and only Son, that whoever believes in
him shall not perish but have eternal life.

· Call or text YES to 321.574.6970 if you have chosen to accept Jesus as your Lord and Savior.

All Bible references are from the New International Version (NIV) unless otherwise noted. NLT = New Living Translation.
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